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* This briefing will introduce the Request for Proposal (RFP) process

* Requests for Proposals (RFPs) must be created by a Contracting Officer or
Contract Specialist using the CHESS IT e-mart https://chess.army.mil

*  You will learn:

CHESS IT e-mart Registration
How a Contracting Officer or Contract Specialist creates and submits an RFP
How to create a draft RFP

How a Contracting Officer or Contract Specialist manages an RFP
* Sharing an RFP
* Amending an RFP
* Canceling an RFP
* Transferring an RFP
How a Vendor views and responds to an RFP response

How a Contracting Officer or Contract Specialist can view RFP submissions

UNCLASSIFIED/Approved for Public Release 2
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Browser Requirements

(u5.ARMY )

Please NOTE:
 The RFP process runs best in Firefox, Internet Explorer 9 or 10 and Google

Chrome.

Not Recommended

Recommended

)
Windows®

y Internet Explorer8

f

@e e ew®

mozilla Internet Explorer 9 Internet Explorer Google Chrome

Microsoft

Firefox
Irerox Edge

e
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* If you do not have an account with the CHESS IT e-mart you must first register in
order to gain access to the RFP Manager.

Login | Register

*

(usaRmyY

CHESS ITE-MART _ _
Amy’s Designated Primary Source for commercial IT C I i ck 13 Reg ISte r” at the

Hardware Software Services RFx Consolidated Buy Resources About CHESS to p rl g ht S eCtI o n of th e
CHESS IT e-mart.

CHESS Mission Statement

that are specified in the link below. Be the Primary Source to support the Warfighter's information dominance objectives by developing, implementing and
contracts that provide enterprise-wide net-centric hardware, software and support services for the Army.

° e 00 0 0 s

UNCLASSIFIED/Approved for Public Release
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Creats An Account

Account Instructions

Use the form bekow 10 create a new account. Withou! an enterprise e-mail address, you will not be able o ufiize the GAC lagon funclionality. IF you have an enterprise é-mail
anddress, please register with that address
Passwards are requined to be a mininum af 15 characters in length. In addition, each paseward must contain

NOTE: CHESS IT e-mart " 2iovercaa ot
users should ensure [
their password is
unique to CHESS and

you do not use New Account
passwords from other - [soea- a

systems (e.g., network,

. . First Name | Last Name
banking, email, etc.)
Email Address |
Password Mone
gentin _— o Fill out the form with

your email address
and select “Register”
| Country [uniTeD sTaTES -]

|
|
|
|

oo | ! L

| Address 2 [ |

o [mm - 201)se50123 |ent | | DSM Phone mE - (201) 5550123
Fax Number Bl - (201) 665-0123

.

Senise o [ -setees - -]

Agency

\
/

UNCLASSIFIED/Approved for Public Release 7
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* If you are not automatically logged-in with your CAC, you will need to login in order
to gain access to certain pages and tools.

Click “Login”

Login | R :gister

CHESS IT E-MART

Army’s Designated Primary Source for commercial IT

Hardware Software Services RFx Consolidated Buy Resources About CHESS Q

CHESS Mission Statement

that are specified in the link below. Be the Primary Source to support the Warfighter's information dominance objectives by developing, implementing and
contracts that provide enterprise-wide net-centric hardware, software and support services for the Army.

[} ® © 0 0 & siop
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Login
You will need to login
to access the RFP T
process. tricia.a.shelley. ctr@mail mil
lgnore -:ertiﬁ-:atel:l
. o H 11 = tE)
After logging in you o Click “Login
will be returned to the
home page _ C“Ck on Ragister if you dont have an sccount.

the RFP
links again.

Your name and last
login will appear in
the top-right corner of
the IT e-mart

Report a Bug | My fccount | Logaurt /

Walcame: Tricia Shelley (CHESS) =
La=t Login: 11212017 B:22 AM EST =

Admin Took | Session Expiration: 14:18 !

Q

UNCLASSIFIED/Approved for Public Release
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Welcome: Tricia Shelley (CHESS) ‘ :

C| IESS E-MAR I Last Login: 12/1/2017 12:43 PM EST 15_
Admin Tools | Session Expiration: 14:57 |2

Amy's Designated Primary Source for commercial IT

My Links Hardware Software Servicag bnsolidated Buy Resources About CHESS A Q

Request for Quote
Request for Proposal |

Request for Information

Hover over “RFx” on

the Main Menu then
click “Request for

Proposal”

Reverse Auction

Statement of Non-Availability

Panasonic Toughpad Battery Recall

Panasonic has recently identified an issue involving the Panasonic Toughpad FZ-G1 tablet incorporating battery packs that are specified in the link below.
http://business.panasonic.com/support-computerstablets-productrecalls




Request For Proposal

RFP - Services hd

[lopen (1) )

Pending Review (35)

261037

* | Step S - Create an RFP

Test Case 10066: Details - Cancel Draft

2019-09-0512:15

US ARMY

PESY EIS
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Actions

CHESS &

COMPUTER HARDWARE,
ENTERPRISE SOFTWARE AND SOLUTIONS

Responses

Responded
Expired (111)
Cancelled
Draft (12)

Create

Reports
Bidding Rate Report

N

To create an RFP from any RFx
page, proceed to the left-hand
menu and select “Create”.

UNCLASSIFIED/Approved for Public Release
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Create Request For Proposal

RFI - Information - RFQ - Hardware\Software ~ RFP - Services « Reverse Auction - Hardware\Software « Bidding Rate Report

Task Order Category
Business Process Reengineering (BPR)
Cloud Hosting < Select a Task Order from
Cyber Security Services
EI);:r:lromc F'rg::lucl Environmental Assessment Tool (EPEAT) th e d ro p d own menu

Enterprise Design, Integration and Consolidation

Independent Verification & Validation (IV&V)

Information Assurance

Information Systems Security

Internet Protocol version 6 (IPvE) Engineering Services .
IT Education & Training

IT Services

IT Supply Chain Management (v
Migration/integration 1T Services

Mobile Cloud Hosting

IModernization

Network Support

Network/Systems Operation & Maintenance

Program/Project Management Support

Telecommunications/Systems Operation and Maintenance

Transition Support

Warranty and Maintenance

Request Name
Title of the Request

Agency and Activity

- Select - v || -Select- W




* Step 7 - Select Type of Request
=)

Create Request For Proposal

RFI - Information « RFQ - Hardware\Software - RFP - Services - Reverse Auction - Hardware\Software -

CHESS ::

COMPUTER HARDWARE,

PED ENTERPRISE INFORMATION SYSTEMS
S— - ENTERPRISE SOFTWARE AND SOLUTIONS

Bidding Rate Report

Task Order Category
- Select - L
Programs:
Select either ACCENT,
ACCENT
:lgss-gs ITES-3S or ITS-SB from
- the drop down menu

Request Name
Title of the Request
Agency and Activity

- Select - N4 - Select -

Installation
- Select - v

Task Order Type
- Select - v

Estimated Task Order Value (including options)
0.00

UNCLASSIFIED/Approved for Public Release
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Create Request For Proposal

RFI - Information « RFQ - Hardware\Software - RFP - Services « Reverse Auction - Hardware\Software Bidding Rate Report

Task Order Category
- Select - v

Programs:
- Select - w

Vendors:

W52P1J-18-D-A136 - CKA. LLG
W52P1J-18-D-A137 - Northrop Grumman

W52P1J-18-D-A138 : CACI ISS, Inc.
W52P1J-18-D-A139 : TekSynap Corporation
W52P1J-18-D-A140 : Ace Info Solutions, Inc

Select All

Note: You must select either one or all.

[ Is this a small business set aside?

Select all vendors unless
the requirement meets one
of the exceptions as
defined in FAR 16.505 (b) or
DFARS 216.505-70.

UNCLASSIFIED/Approved for Public Release



US ARMY

A | PEY EIS | EHESS
Step O - Enter Requwem ent P e g S COMPUTRR MARBMARE, | scxsicns
U

Requestor Role

Contract Specialist v

Acquisition Title/Subject

Title of the Request (1) Name the RFP

Agency and Activity

- Select - v | -Select- v
Installation (2) Select your Agency

~Select - v & Activity

Description

Enter the details of your request. Provide a quantity for each product. Include sufficient information/details about your requirement so that the vendor can provide you with an accurate quote. Include POC information if there is someone the vendors can
calllemail if there are questions about the requirement. NOTE: You are limited to 4000 characters. Use the file attachment feature below if you need more space

(3) Enter information about the RFP. Please be sure to provide proposal
delivery instructions (e.g. email, hardcopy) in your RFP posting.

Characters left: 4000

UNCLASSIFIED/Approved for Public Release
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Notice: Please ensure uploaded attachments DO NOT contain vendor proprietary information (competitor pricing, discounts, etc.). This is unfair competition. Instances of this will be reported to the CHESS Product Officer (PO).

Attachments

You may upload with a maximum file size of 5 megabytes (MB) per file. Only the following file types will be accepted: Adobe Acrobat PDF (.pdf) Excel (.xls & .xIsx) TIFF Files (.tiff Word (.doc & .docx)

Browse... | Clear

Browse . | Clear
Browse... | Clear
Browse... | Clear

Browse... | Clear

You may attach up to 5 NOTE: Please DO NOT
files of 5SMB each. add an attachment with
(The system accommodates other vendor pricing!
Word, Excel, PDF, TIF)

UNCLASSIFIED/Approved for Public Release



@ Step 11 - Dates

Dates

Acknowledge Expected Date (Date the vendor is expected to look at the customer requirement as per the Base Agreement)
9/M13/2019

Customer Required By Date (Date that you need to have a response back from the vendor)

9/25/2019

Customer Required B)’ Time {Time that you need to have a response back from the VEI'IUUF}
Hour(s): 12 ~  Minute(s): 00 ~ ET (ALL TIMES EASTERN)

US ARMY

PEY EIS | EHESS

PEQ ENTERPRISE INFORMATION SYSTEMS COMPUTER HARDWARE,
S— - ENTERPRISE SOFTWARE AND SOLUTIONS

To alter the
“Customer
\ Required By
Date” date
click on
the date.
Dates can not
equal current
date.

NOTE:
can

Acknowledge Expected Date: 2 Days
Response Expected Date: 3 Days

(Time frame is in business days and

Date Time Frames

Due Date: 10 Days

does not include holidays)

The “Customer Required By Date”
be altered but we ask you follow the
time frame when applicable.

UNCLASSIFIED/Approved for Public Release
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Contact Information

Submitting POC: Customer POC:
Mame: Tricia Shelley First Mame: Tricia
Email Address: tricia.a shelley_ctr@mail mil
Requestor Role: Contract Specialist Last Name: Shelley
Commercial Phone: 7033089087
Submit contact
i n fO rm atl on abO ut Email address: tricia. a_shelley cin@mail mil
.en d us er" ThlS Customer POC Role: Contract Specialist
information is >
maintained by o . . Hon.
CH ESS, b ut not Organization: O] Army Ammy
Shared W|th VendOI’S . [Select one from this list. Use "OTHER" if unknown or not found in the list)
Answer basic Contracting questions
regarding this requirement.
Enter Details About Your Proposal Request
Is this a performance based task order? ® Yes O Mo
Is this a new Requirement? [C] Yes 0 Mo
I this Task Order in compliance with the Clinger-Cohen Act? ® Yes o Mo

Click to submit RFP ———> ((___s#mt | Jawessoen || comet |
S

UNCLASSIFIED/Approved for Public Release
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My Links * Hardware ~ Software + Services + RFx~ Consolidated Buy *~ Resources *  About CHESS + All = | Search n
Request For Proposal

an

Created Actions Responses Transfer

 Fenaing review OB 261316 Security Updates 2019-09-11 12:54 2019-09-25 (1200 ET) 0135 O

Expiea @) 261315 Nntenanoe Required 2019-09-11 12:53 2019.09.25 (12:00 ET) 01135 0

gf;;egf__s) 261314 Te}wg RFP 10033 2019-09-11 12:40 2019-09-25 (1200 ET) 0135 O

= 261006 Test Case Nd0: Creae Draft 2019-09-05 12:14 2019.09-09 (3:00 ET) 01135 0

Create 261007 Test Case e\ Edit Draft 2019-09-05 12:14 2019-11-08 (1300 ET) 0185 O
Transfer

 epors | 260894 Testing Retest 17283\1up|icate 521 2019-09-05 12:11 2019.09-09 (11:00 ET) 01135 0
Reports

Bidding Rate Report Once your RFP is submitted click on 20190813 (10:00 £T) on3s m

Pending Review” to view. The RFP 2015-10.04 (1000 €1) | oetas | oms o

3 . c - il [

will be sent to either the CHESS Gate A0S 00T, po

Keeper or the Army Application
Migration Business Office (AAMBO)
depending on the contract vehicle
selected. Upon review, your RFP will
either be released to the vendor(s) for
action “Open” or administratively
canceled.

NOTE: RFP’s will not be
visible to the vendors
until the gatekeeper
accepts the RFP
submission

UNCLASSIFIED/Approved for Public Release
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My Links ~ Hardware = Software ~ Services + RFx ~  Consolidated Buy ~  Resources =  About CHESS ~ All = | Search n
Request For Proposal
Ref # Name Created Due Actions Responses Transfer
open (7) . =
Pending Review (%) 261316 Security Updales 2019-09-11 12:54 2019-08-25 (12:00 ET) 01135
Responded (106) . : i
i 261315 Maintenance Required 2019-09-11 12:53 2019-09-25 (12:00 ET) 01135 ]
Expired (111)
gf:;eg% 261314 Tesling RFP 10033 2019-09-11 12:40 2019-09-25 (12:00 ET) 01135 0O
[ Actons | 261006 Test Case 640: Create Draft 2019-09-05 12:14 2019-09-09 (13:00 ET) 01135 []
Create 261007 Test Case 641: Edit Draft 2019-09-05 12:14 2019-11-08 (13:00 ET) /85 m|
Transfer
260894 Testing Retest 17283 - duplicate 5/21 2019-09-05 12:11 2019-09-09 (11:00 ET) 01135 []
Bidding Rate Report 260618 Testing RFP Draft Creation 2019-09-05 12:09 2019-08-13 (10:00 ET) 0135 m|
260699 Testing RFP Draft 2019-09-05 12:09 2019-10-04 (10:00 ET) 0/35 []
NE447 Toctina DEN ITEC2C Dieaft an40 00 NE AN-FA 040 00 NE £44-00 CT) Nni9E —1

the index.

Once your RFP is submitted and

approved your screen will look like

this. The RFP index will show your
recently submitted RFP at the top 9 of

SSIFIED/Approved for Public Release

NOTE: Your screen will
automatically update
every 90 days and auto
archive outdated RFP’s
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submitted RFP L

Click “Details”

button to the
RFP
RFP - #261500 - Testing RETest 19939 o line item you

would like to
[ _orgnal |
[ petais |

expand for a
detailed view

Responses

General Information

Ref# 261500 Version (Amendments) (Original)
Status Responded Last Updated 10/4/2019

10/18/2019
Created O 10/4/2019 RFP Closing Date
feated tin e 15:00 ET
Acknowledgment Expected 10/8/2019
Program ITES-38

Task Qrder Category Business Process Reengineering (BPR) Task Order Type 'I(':::; c?:::m
CT)

Reguest Name Testing RETest 19939

Description text

Small Business Set Aside? Mo

Socio-Economic Classification?

Agency COAST GUARD

A
Activity

UNCLASSIFIED/Approved for Public Release
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* The Contracting Officer or Contract Specialist RFP submission will be sent to either
the CHESS Gate Keeper or the Army Application Migration Business Office
(AAMBO). Upon review, your RFP will either be released to the vendor(s) for action
“Open” or administratively canceled.

* Once approved the Contracting Officer or Contract Specialist and vendor will
receive an RFP notification via email from the CHESS IT e-mart.

 The vendor responds to the RFP.

* The Contracting Officer or Contract Specialist receives email notification that RFP
responses have been posted to their RFP Manager.

* The Contracting Officer or Contract Specialist logs back into the RFP Manager to
view responses.

UNCLASSIFIED/Approved for Public Release
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* Once your RFP is approved you will receive an email from CHESS like the one

below.

Dear Tricia Shelley,
You have just successfully submitted a new Request for Proposal (RFP) through the CHESS IT e-mart. Details of your request are below:

Title: Testing RFP

Program: ITES-2S

Reference Number: 206222

Description: Testing RFP

Date Created: 1/3/2018

Customer Required By Date: 1/10/2018

Vendors Selected: Apptis Inc.
IBM
Leidos
Northrop Grumman
NCI Information Systems
Dell Federal Systems
CSRALLC
HP Enterprise Services
BAE
STG, Inc.
Booz Allen Hamilton, Inc.
CACI IS5, Inc.
SAIC
General Dynamics
Pragmatics, Inc.
Harris IT Services Corporation

You may also view the details of your Request by logging into the Request Tool.
Please check the Request Tool regularly to see if you have received any responses from the vendors.

Thank you for using the CHESS IT e-mart system!

This email was generated automatically. DO NOT REPLY. Questions should be directed to the CHESS Customer Support Team at: armychess@mail.mil or (888) 232-4405.

PLEASE NOTE THIS IS PROPRIETARY INFORMATION AND SHOULD NOT BE SHARED WITH OTHER VENDORS.
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* Each vendor receives an email, which looks similar to this one, alerting them of
your RFP.

Classification: =
UNCLASSIFIED

Caveats: NONE

The CHESS IT e-mart has brought you a potential customer! By accessing the

RFP below, you are acknowledging the receipt of the RFP.

Please coordinate with the customer concerning their pending RFP by logging

into the RFP Manager.

Keep in mind that CHESS customers are awaiting your response, and your
timeliness in addressing their RFPs is greatly appreciated. 2
Thank you for using the CHESS IT e-mart system!

Please feel free to contact CHESS at: (888) 232-4405 if you have any

questions.

Classification:

UNCLASSIFIED B
Caveats: NONE 2

UNCLASSIFIED/Approved for Public Release
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Creating a Draft RFP
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Contact Information

Submitting POC: Customer POC:
Name: Tricia Shelley First Name: Tricia
Email Address: tricia_a.shelley_ctri@mail.mil
£ Last Name: Shell
Requestor Role: Confract Specialist =
Commercial Phone: T038089057
Email address: tricia.a.shelley.cin@mail. mil
Customer POC Role: Contract Spacialist
_ Mon-
Organization: ® Army o
Army
[Select one from this kst Use "OTHER" if unknown or not found in the list)

Enter Details About Your Proposal Request

Is this a performance based task order? 0 Yes ] Mo
If you are working an
Is this a new Requirement? RFP and are nOt Yes ] Mo
quite ready to submit
Is this Task Order in compliance with the Clinger-Cehen Act? click the “Save As Yes (@] Mo
Draft” button.

Submit Savz As Dra&).ancel |

UNCLASSIFIED/Approved for Public Release
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i“'\(? Step 2 - View RFP Drafts

List of Draft Requests
TR
Ref # Name Created Due Actions Responses
Open (3)
Ponding Review | 261495 Testing ITES-35 LB Draft Creation 2018-10-04 (1229 £T) 2013-10-18 (12:00 ET) Delete 01135
Responded (79) ) -
Exred N Testing RFI Create 2019-09-25 (1410 ET) 2019-10-18 (1555 £T) | Detais | Fait [N 0135 m
ancelled ( 50) N . ] - -
< (Draf ) | 2102 \ Testing RFP Draft Create 2019-09-25 (14:07 ET) 2019-10-09 (14:00 ET) Delete 0135 O
\ 261388 TESﬁnMEC Draft Creation from SRV PROco 2019-09-20 (14:41 ET) 2019-10-04 (14:40 £T) | Detais | Fait [N 0135 m
Create 261386 | Testing SB RFP Dxgft Creation from SRV PROco 2019-09-20 (14.38 ET) 2019-10-04 (14:00 ET) Edit D 0185 O
Transfer \\ --
Jesting LRG Business. Creation from SRV ) ’ N
- 261384 \ o 2019-09-20 (14:35 ET) 2019-10-04 (14:00 £T) | Detais | Eoit [N 0135 0
Bidding Rate Report 261330 Tealinwe displaw 2019-09-12 (09:52 ET) 2019-09-26 (0900 ET) Delete 0135 O
(DRAFT) ITES3S (BPR) with SS<ubZone- DN _ ; ——
261269 a01s - 2019-08-26 (1646 £T) 2019-09-04 (16:00 £T) Delete o4 |
260933 ITES3S 8a IT Education & Training \\\Qg-os-zz (1414 ET) 2019-06-05 (1355 ET) 0M1 O
260918 ITES3S WOSB 20 (1206 ET) 2019-06-04 (12:00 ET) @ Delete 0128 O
You will automatically be defaulted to the
13
RFQ Index page. Hover over the “RFP-
H ” 13 th)
Services” button and select “Draft” for a
list of your Draft Requests.
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List of Draft Requests
TR
Ref # Name Created Due Actions Responses
Open (3)
Ponding Review 261495 Testing ITES-35 LB Draft Creation 2018-10-04 (1229 £T) 2013-10-18 (12:00 ET) Delete 01135
Responded i -
Expired (135) 261405 Testing RFI Create 2019-09-25 (1410 ET) 2019-10-18 (1555 £T) w Delete 0135 m
Cancelled ] . -
261402 Testing RFP Draft Create 2019-09-25 (14:07 ET) 2019-10-09 (14:00 ET) Delete 0135 O
[ Draft
= 261388 | Testing SBSA SEC Draft Greation from SRV PROco 2019-09-20 (14:41 ET) 2019-10-04 (14:40 £T) w Delete 0135 m
Create 261386 | Testing SB RFP Draft Creation from SRV PROco 2019-09-20 (14:38 ET) 2019-10-04 (14:00 ET) - Delete /85 O
Transfer
Testing LRG Business Draft Creation from SRV ) ’ N
- 261384 P 2019-09-20 (14:35 ET) 2019-10-04 (14:00 £T) | Detais | Eoit [N 0135 m
Bidding Rate Report 261330 Testing the zero badge display on Draft 2019-09-12 (09.52 ET) 2019-09-26 (0900 £T) Delete 0135 O
261269 | DRAFTIITES3S (BF;E;;:'QSB HubZone-Due on 2019-08-26 (16:46 ET) 2019-09-04 (16:00 ET) Delete /4 O
260933 ITES3S 8a IT Education & Training 2019-05.22 (1414 ET) 2019-06-05 (1355 ET) 0M1 O
260918 ITES3S WOSB 2019-05-21 (12:06 ET) 2019-06-04 (12:00 ET) @ Delete 0128 O
H H)
On this page all the Drafts RFP’s you are

currently working on will be listed.
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List of Draft Req uests
RFF' Services Search Search
Ref # Created Actions Responses
Open @
Ponding Review 261495 Testing ITES-35 LB Draft Creation 2018-10-04 (1229 £T) 2013-10-18 (12:00 ET) m Edit [ 01135
Responded (79) ) § -
Exred @’ 261405 Testing RFI Create 2019-09-25 (1410 ET) 2019-10-18 (1555 £T) Delete 0135 m
Cancelled
ancee 261402 Testing RFP Draft Create 2019-09-25 (14:07 ET) 2019-10-09 (14:00 ET) Delete 0135 O
[ Draft
= 261388 | Testing SBSA SEC Draft Greation from SRV PROco 2019-09-20 (14:41 ET) 2019-10-04 (14:40 £T) / @ Delete 0135 O
Create 261386 | Testing SB RFP Draft Creation from SRV PROco 2019-09-20 (14:38 ET) 2019-10-04 m.M Delete /85 O
Transfer
Testing LRG Business Draft Creation from SRV ) g
- 261384 P 2019-09-20 (14:35 ET) 201910-0/4(410 ET) | Detais | Eoit [N 0135 m
Bidding Rate Report 261330 Testing the zero badge display on Draft 2019-09-12 (09.52 ET) 2%2& (09:00 ET) Delete 0135 O
261269 | (DRAFTIITES3S (BF;E;;:'QSB R B T 2019-08-26 (16:46 ET) ﬁ)mﬂ&m (16:00 ET) Delete /4 O
260933 ITES3S 8a IT Education & Training Select 1 Edit Draft” whenever you Details Delete 011 O
260918 ITES3S WOSB need to make changes to your RFP. |pesis Delete 0
. 2 Next> Last=>
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Edit Draft RFP

RFI - Information RFQ - Hardware\Software RFP - Services Reverse Auction - Hardware\Software: Bidding Rate Report

You are editing the draft. This request has not been submitted yet
Programs
ITES-2S

Vendors

W31QUZ-06-D-0010 - IBM
- Dell Federal Systems
: General Dynamics
: HP Enterprise Services
- Appiis Inc.
W31QUZ-06-D-0015 : STG, Inc.

Note: You must select either one or all

Request Name Make any necessary changes to your RFP scroll
e Lt biaes down and click “Finalize/Submit.” You also have

Agency and Activity . u:
poee AR FORCES COMNAND the option to “Delete Draft” as well. '
Installation

ENGINEER DISTRICT

Estimated Task Order Value (including options)  Enter Details About Your Proposal Request

0.00
Is this a performance based task order? Yes Ol No
Description
Enter the details of your request. Provide a quanti i o sodals eget accumsan o, nerdum et ern. Nullafclls. Suspsndisse quisrutrum e,
questions about the requirement NGTE: You are Please provide a reason why this isn't a performance based task: . ribh. I porta fictur congue. Palontasce sciia in oerosed proum. Nullsid faueious isl.
Aenean viverra oNgre eros niec eficitur. Nam erat dolor, matiis eget nulla at, gravida omare sem. Vestibulum
{- Selected Services/Impact Levels: laaS - Impact Level Characters lafti 3042 N\,
Morbi consequat pharetra arcu. Phasellus elit orci, feugi 1s this a new Requirement? ® No

magnis dis parturient montes, nascetur ridiculus mus. P1

Characters left: 2706 Is this Task Order in compliance with the Clinger-Cohen Act? No

. terdum et enim. Nulla facilisi. Suspendisse quis rutrum ante,
Provide justification why this Task Order is not in compliance with the Clinger-Cohen Act

Aenean viverra omare eros nec efficitur. Nam eralNolor, matiis eget nulla at, gravida omare sem. Vestibulum

Finalize / Submit Save As Draft Delete Draft
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How to Share an RFP =
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If you have someone on your team that you wish to share your RFP information with
you can click the “Share” button on the RFP line item. This will allow the person read
only access.

Request For Proposal
Created Responses
[ Ej:;ngegwew D | 1 2600 This Is a Test 2019-10-08 (11:35 ET) 2019-10-25 (14:00 £T) [ Detalls | Amend ‘ carfel ‘ Share | 01135 O
E:S,F::;d 261375 || ooing SBSA SECAﬁzz‘:;;;'E; EmaIHReE 2019-09-27 (16:17 ET) 2019-10-11 (14:00 £T) Details \—/& 0135 0
ancelled (50)
gmﬁ = 261419 RFP Create 09262019 2nd version 2019-09-26 (13:31 ET) 2019-10-10 (13:00 £T) Details \ 0135 |
[ Actions | 261037 Test Case 10066: Details - Cancel Draft 2019-09-05 (12:15 ET) 2019-10-11 (12:00 ET) Details \ 01135 0
Trarster
Bidding Rate Report
Start typing the
last name of the
SRS person you wish to
- share with and a Click the “Share”
20120103  Share fo: ‘ I t H ” I tet 2
ist will populate to button to provide
2‘"“‘% User: .| choose from, then read only access to
2018-01-03 Shelley C||Ck Sme|t anyone in our
2‘"”’"% =) | CHESS IT e-mart
2018-01-03 | Details | I d atab ase.
2013-01-% ‘ | [ Detais | I
2018-01-03 “I23""""""‘I""""ZU183UT:HF""""("“““(Iﬂ!f““““‘[“’ | Details | I

UNCLASSIFIED/Approved for Public Release



How to Share an RFP

U.S.ARMY ¥

Share Request{s}

not be able to act on it. Are you sure?

Share to:
User:
Message from webpage
o Sharing this [RFQ, RFP, RFl, RA] with tricia.a.shelley.ctr@mail.mil

will provide them with a read-only view of the request. You will
still be able to act on it. If you intend to transfer this same
request later for action by the person you shared it with, they will

]

US ARMY

PE® EIS | CHESS

PEQ ENTERPRISE INFORMATION SYSTEMS COMPUTER HARDWARE,
S— - ENTERPRISE SOFTWARE AND SOLUTIONS

Once you have entered the
name of the person you

2018
2018 m

o

2014

N

Cancel

wish to share your RFP with, a
confirmation screen will appear.

Click OK to continue.

UNCLASSIFIED/Approved for Public Release
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Amending an RFP
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Amen ingan RFP "= | EEEESLS

5 ARMY

The Amendment feature allows you to:

 Update an RFP at any time in the process
e Clarify the details of a requirement
* Notify vendors of updates or new deadlines

UNCLASSIFIED/Approved for Public Release



Request For Proposal

RFP - Services v n

[ Open @

]

Pending Revigy
Responded (79)
Expired @
Cancelled
Draft

Create
Transfer

Bidding Rate Report

N

@ Amending an RFP

This is a Test

Created

2019-10-08 (11:35 ET)

2019-10-25 (1100 ET)

US ARMY

BES EIS

PEQ ENTERPRISE INFORMATION SYSTEMS
— -

Actions

CHESS &

COMPUTER HARDWARE,
ENTERPRISE SOFTWARE AND SOLUTIONS

Responses

Testing SBSA SEC RFP Creatfion from SRV PROco

Amended 927 2013-09-27 (1617 ET) 2019-10-11 (14:00 ET) ﬂ Details 0/135 n
261415\ RFP Create 09262019 2nd version 2019-09-26 (1331 ET) 2019-10-10 (13.00 ET) / Details 0135
261037 \ Test Case 10066: Details - Cancel Draft 2019-09-05 (12:15 ET) 2019-10-11 (12:00 ET) / Details 01135

Ensure you are on the

“RFP - Services” Index page
and within the “Open” tab,
then click the “Amend”

link

to the right of your RFP.

SSIFIED/Approved for Public Release
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Create Request For Proposal

RFI - information RFQ - HardwareS: RFF - Services Rewerse Auction - Hardware'\Software Bidding Rete Report

Program:
ITES-25

Cenfracts:

WE1QUZ-08-D-0010 - IBM
WE1QUZ-08-0-0011 - Dell Federal Systems
WE1QUZ-08-D-0012 - General Dynamics
WWB1QUZ-08-D-0013 - HP Enterprise Services
WE1QUZ-08-D-0014 - Apptis Inc.
WE1QUZ-08-D-0015 - STG, Inc.
WE1QUZ-08-0-0018 - SAIC
WB1QUZ-08-D-0017 - Leidos
WE1QUZ-08-0-0018 - CSRA LLC
WO1QUZ-08-0-0019 - Booz Allen Hamilton, Inc.
WE1QUZ-08-0-0020 - CACI ISS, Inc.
WB1QUZ-07-0-0001 - Harris IT Services Corporsation
WE1QUZ-07-0-0002 - Pragmatics, Inc.
WE1QUZ-07-0-0003 - BAE
WB1QUZ-07-0-0004 - NCI Informsation Systems
WE1QUZ-07-0-0005 - Marthrop Grumman

Reguest Mame
Tasting RFP

Agency and Activity

ARMY ARMY MEDICAL COMMAND
Installation
FORT BELVOIR

Esfimated Task Order Value (including options)
0.00

Deserption Update information

Enter the detsils of your request. Provide a quantity for each pry ment 5o that the vendor can provide you with an sccurste quote. Include POC information

if there is someone the MHW | n t h e DeS C I’ | ptl 0 n tharacters. Use the file sttschment feature below if you need more space
field as required.

Charseters it 0D

B

NCLASSIFIED/Approved for Public Release
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o

Notice: Please ensure uploaded attachments DO NOT contain vendor proprietary information (competitor pricing, discounts, etc.). This is unfair competition. Instances of this will be reported to the CHESS Product Officer (PO).

Attachments

You may upload with a maximum file size of 5 megabytes (MB) per file. Only the following file types will be accepted: Adobe Acrobat PDF (.pdf) Excel (.xls & .xlsx) TIFF Files (.tiff Word (.doc & .docx)

Browse... | Clear

You may attach up to 5
files of 5MB each.

(The system accommodates Browse._
Word, Excel, PDF, TIF)

Browse .. | Clear

Clear

Browse... | Clear

Browse... | Clear

This allows you to attach new files.

*NOTE: Your original files are still attached. Only add
additional attachments if those files need to be updated or
anew file is to be submitted.

UNCLASSIFIED/Approved for Public Release
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PEQ ENTERPRISE INFORMATION SYSTEMS COMPUTER HARDWARE,
S— - ENTERPRISE SOFTWARE AND SOLUTIONS

Contact Information

Submitting POC: Customer POC:
Name: Tricia Shelley First Mame: Tricia
Email Address: tricia.a.shelley_ctr@mail .mil
. Last M 3 Shell
Requestor Role: Contract Specialist astame -
Commercial Phone: 7035069087
Email address: tricia.a.shelley ciri@mail mil
Customer POC Role: Contract Specialist
_ Man-
Organization: - Army ] Amy
[Select one from this ist. Use "OTHER™ if unknown or not found in the list)
Enter Details About Your Proposal Request
Is this a performance based task order? [C] Yes o] No
Is this a new Requirement? ] Yes @] No
Is this Task Order in compliance with the Clinger-Cohen Act? ® Yes o] Nao
Click to submit RFP ———> somt__ || Ypve st || cance |

UNCLASSIFIED/Approved for Public Release
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Once your RFP is
amended your

screen will look

| I ke th IS. Created Actions Responses
0
[ p::;;ngeview ] 261503 This is a Test 2019-10-08 (11:35 ET) 2019-10-25 (1100 £T) NOTE: The Status |
Responded Testing SBSA SEC RFP Creation from SRV PROco i
Expired 261378 | o9 e d;f;;;' om 2019-09-27 (16:17 ET) 2019-10-11 (14:00 £T) hCO lu m;’l WI:-]| not O
Cancelled
Draft 261419 RFP Create 09262019 2nd version 2019-09-26 (13:31 ET) 2019-10-10 (13.00 ET) change for the RFP
you recently
[ Actions | 261037 Test Case 10066: Details - Cancel Draft 2019-09-05 (1215 ET) 2019-10-11 (12:00 ET)
Create am en d Ed 0
Transfer Once your RFP
amendment is
Bidding Rate Report .
e e submitted your

like this. A 7

bar at the bottom of
the page will
indicate that your
RFP has been
amended.

UNCLASSIFIED/Approved for Public Release
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The Cancel feature allows you to:

e Cancel an RFP at any time in the process
* Notify vendors of updates and the cancellation of an RFP
* The Contracting Officers or Contract Specialists may both cancel RFPs

UNCLASSIFIED/Approved for Public Release
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Request For Proposal

ST
R Created Actions Responses

e 1\ G ome 3
N\ P 1) o 10 . - {
Pending Rev \261503 This is a Test 2019-10-08 (11:35 £T) 2019-10-25 (11:00 ET) Details | Afend | Cancel | Sh)e 0135 O
Responded Testing SBSA SEC RFP Creati
t g reation from SRV PRCco| ’ ) |:]
Expired 267878 Amended 9727 2019-09-27 (16:17 ET) 2019-10-11 (14:00 ET) Details 01135 0
Cancelled .
Draft 261419\\ RFP Create 09262019 2nd version 2019-09-26 (13:31 ET) 2019-10-10 (13.00 ET) / Details 01135
[ Actions | ‘\%103? \Qst Case 10066: Details - Cancel Draft 2019-09-05 (1215 ET) 2019-10-11 (12:00 ET) / Details 0135
Create
Transfer

Bidding Rate Report

Ensure you are on the
“RFP - Services” Index and
within the “Open” filter
page then click the “Cancel”
link to the right of your RFP.
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Cregied
Cancellation Confirmation

Sreate 113 Are you sure you would like to cancel this request?
1 RFF

Cancel -

Reason | Change in Hequiremen i |
ate 12/20 2

Cancel
e Comments
mr%
arkflow Te:

Choose a Cancel Reason

P Create 1/2 2018-01-02 15:54 from the drop down

Menu and enter any

Comments. NOTE: Once you
select “Yes” you
will not be able
to edit your
RFP. It will be
cancelled.

UNCLASSIFIED/Approved for Public Release



US ARMY

BES EIS

PEQ ENTERPRISE INFORMATION SYSTEMS
— -

CHESS &

COMPUTER HARDWARE,
ENTERPRISE SOFTWARE AND SOLUTIONS

@ Cancelling an RFP

Request For Proposal
TR
Ref # Name Created Due Actions Responses
Open @
Pending Review 261422 RFP Create 09262019 3rd version 2019-09-26 (16:07 ET) 2019-10-10 (13:00 ET) Details 0135
Responded
P 261418 RFP Create 09262019 2019-09-26 (13:30 ET) 2019-10-10 (13:00 ET) Details 0135
Expired (135)
SRR =0 261407 RFP Create 09252019 Hotfix 2019-09-25 (14:12 ET) 2019-10-09 (14:00 ET) Details 0135
Draft
= 261394 Testing RFP Create 2019-09-25 (13:41 ET) 2019-10-09 (13:40 ET) Details 0/85
Create 261376 Testing SB RFP Creation from SRV PROco 2019-09-20 (14:04 ET) 2019-10-04 (14:00 ET) Details 0135
Transfer
- 261371 Testing Large Business RFP Creation from SRV PROco 2019-09-20 (13:39 ET) 2019-10-04 (13:00 ET) Details 0135
Reporis
\
Bidding Rate Report \261 007 Test Case 641: Edit Draft 2019-09-05 (1214 ET) 2019-11-08 (13:00 ET) Details 0/85
Mz Testing REP Pending Review Create 2019-09-05 (10:37 ET) 2019-09-19 (10:00 ET) Details 01135
Once your RFP is ew View and Approval Process 2019-09-05 (10:20 ET) 2019-09-19 (10-00 ET) Details 01135
cancelled the Status ng RFI Create 2019-08-27 (15:56 ET) 2019-09-10 (15:55 ET) Details 0135
S Change -
(B2 3 4 5 Next> Last>>
13 bk H
Cancelled” and you will

no longer see the
cancelled RFP in the
“Open”. To view
cancelled RFP’s you will
need to select the
“Cancelled” filter.

NOTE: Once the
RFP is cancelled
you will have to
submit a new
RFP if you have
anew requirement.

) SSIFIED/Approved for Public Release )



UsS ARMY ARMY ]|
| ] ]
H n
HEEE
(1]
GOMPUTER HARDWARE
PEC] ENTERFRISE INFORMATION SYSTEMS | ENTERPRISE SOFTWARE AND SOLUTIONS

Transferring an RFP
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The Transfer feature allows you to:

* Transfer an RFP at any time in the process to another user
 User is able to transfer multiple RFP’s at once to another user

 The person who submitted or anyone with administrative authority may
transfer/reassign the RFP

UNCLASSIFIED/Approved for Public Release
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e contract Specialist Transfers an RFP

Request For Proposal

RFP - Services

N Created

[oren @ N ‘ .
Pending Review @ Qﬁ[ﬂ This is a Test 2019-10-08 (11:35 ET) 2019-10-25 (11:00 ET) I Details | Amend | Cancel | Share l 013 ﬂ
Responded (79) Testing SBSA SEC RFP Creation from SRV PROco
Expired 26%\ = Aenden o 2019-09-27 (16:17 ET) 2019-10-11 (14.00 ET) Details // 0135 // O
Cancelled (50) N
Draft 261419 \RFP Create 09262019 2nd version 2019-09-26 (13:31 ET) 2019-10-10 (13:00 ET) y{ O
Actions 261037 TN& 10066: Details - Cancel Draft 2019-09-05 (12:15 ET) 2019-10-11 (12:00 ET) /@etails / 0135 O

i

Repuis

Create
Transfer \

Bidding Rate Report

Ensure you are on the
“RFP - Services” Index Page then click
the checkbox under the Transfer
column found to the right of your
RFP and then click “Transfer” either
in the Transfer column or under the
“Actions” filter.

NOTE: If you click on
multiple checkboxes
you will be able to
transfer multiple RFP’s
to one person

UNCLASSIFIED/Approved for Public Release
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wContract Specialist Transfers an RFP

Once you start typing
this field will auto
populate with a list of
users pertinent to your
search.

Transfer Request

[ o |

Transfer to:

] User:
|

ellollolfaflo]

E-T- T F . R

Submit contact
information about
end user. This

o |

information is
maintained by Then click “Submit” to
CHESS, but not Transfer the RFP.
shared with
vendors.

UNCLASSIFIED/Approved for Public Release
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Transfer Request

How a Contracting Officer or
C

ontract Specialist Transfers an RFP

uuuuuu

PEQ ENTERPRISE INFORMATION SYSTEMS
— —

25 RFR

T RFP

Message from webpage

Once you hit save to transfer
your RFP a confirmation
screen will appear. Click OK
to continue. Once you refresh
your screen your RFP will no
longer appear.

Transferring this [RFQ, RFP, RFl, RA] to Dennis, Monica
(monica.m.dennis2.ctr@mail.mil) will give them full rights to

E amend, cancel, or share this request. You will not be able to act
on it unless it's transferred back to you. Are you sure?

(_x D

Cancel

/

UNCLASSIFIED/Approved for Public Release

NOTE: The RFP that

was transferred will
no longer appear in
your list of RFP’s.

CHESS ::
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Vendor View
of

RFP Submissions
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Request For Proposal - Open

RFP - Services v ATAT Government Solutions, Inc - W52P1J-18-D-+ v

Ref# Name SBSA Created Due Response Actions

[Open (5) | || 261500 Testing RETest 19939 2019-10-04 (15 29 £T) 2019-10-18 (1500 ET) No Bid
Responded
Expired 2613 7R Lesind SEESSECRERCrecioninaS R O ce sb 2019-09-27 (16:17 ET) 2019-10-11 (14:00 ET) m@» pid
Cancelled Amended 9/27

261419 RFP Create 09262019 2nd version 2019-09-26 (13:31 ET) 2019-10-10 (13:00 ET) /7 1 Details | Respond | No Bid I
Bidding Rate Report 261409 RFP Create 09252019 Hotfix (dupe) 2019-09-25 (14:14 ET) 2019-10-09 (14:00 ET) // No Bid

261037 Test Case 10066- Details - Cancel Draft 2019.09.05 (1215 ET) 2019-10-11 (12:00 ET) / No Bid

~

In order to respond to a
Once Vendors login, they particular RFP, the Vendor
will see a screen that looks must click the “Respond” link

like this. to the right of the RFP.

UNCLASSIFIED/Approved for Public Release
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A Vendor uses an online
form to submit a response,
Comment (bid or “no bid”), but will

submit proposal
documents to the
Contracting Officer or
Contract Specialist via the
4 Attachments tool.

Response for RFxd# - 260851 - Testing RFP Create

Characters left: 4000

Quote Total

Attachments

You may upload with a maximum file size of 5 megabytes (MB) per file. Only the following file types will be accepted:

Adobe Acrobat PDF (.pdf) Excel (.xIs & xlsx) TIFF Files (.tiff Word (.doc & .docx)
E=NC
(s [om]

G
Browse... Clear| -

You may attach up to 5
files of 5SMB each.

(The system accommodates
Word, Excel, PDF, TIF)

Vendor clicks “Submit” to respond to RFP

UNCLASSIFIED/Approved for Public Release



US ARMY

'Vendor Responds to an RFP =

Once aresponse is
submitted the bar at the
bottom of the page will
indicate the response as

shown and the RFP will be
Request For Proposal - Open moved to the “Responded”

RFP - Senvices v AT&T Government Solutions, Inc : W52P1J-18-D4 v page.

Created Response Actions
[(Open (5) | || 261500 Testing RETest 19939 2019-10-04 (15:29 £ 2019-10-18 (15:00 ET) m No Bid
Responded
Expired e || EDSEREID AP Cenimirm SRy R sb 2019-09-27 (16:17 FT) 2019-10-11 (14:00 ET) m No Bid
Cancelled Amended 927 \
261419 RFP Create 09262019 2nd version 2019-09-26 (13.3/ ET) 2018-10-10 (13:00 ET) @ No Bid I
Bidding Rate Report 261409 RFP Create 09252019 Hotfix (dupe) 2019-09-25 (14/4 ET) 2019-10-09 (14:00 ET) m No Bid :
261037 Test Case 10066: Detalls - Cancel Draft 2019-09-05 (1;. 15ET) 2018-10-11 (12:00 ET) m No Bid ,<

v

TR E 2 R mee o (A VP
id = 208217

UNCLASSIFIED/Approved for Public Release



US ARMY

St E1s | EHess &

PEQ ENTERPRISE INFORMATION SYSTEMS COMPUTER HARDWARE,

.* Vendor Views Responded RFPs o

Request For Proposal - Responded

RFP - Senvices v AT&T Government Solutions, Inc : W52P1J-18-D-+ v

Respu nded o

g \ a Resnonse Actions
< OPE” 261500 Testing RETest 19939 2019-10-04 (15:29 ET) 2019-10-18 (15:00 ET) V Details
[

Cancelled @

Bidding Rate Report

A Vendor needs to ensure they are on
the “Responded” page selecting “RFP -

Services” and clicking “Responded” in Once aresponse is
order to see a list of ALL responded submitted the Status will
requests. change to “Responded.”

UNCLASSIFIED/Approved for Public Release
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Contracting Officer or
Contract Specialist

View of
RFP Submissions

56



A Contracting Officer or BES E1S | EHess
Contract Specialist Reviews Bids = = [ mommmeses

0]

(u..ARMY)

RFP - #261503 - This is a Test

Vendor Acknowledged Responded

Universal
Consulting
Services, Inc.

McLane
Advanced
Technologies,
LLC

Raytheon
Company

Booz Allen
Hamilton, Inc.

Credence
Management
Solutions, LLC

Leidos

0/135 indicates number of

vendors that have responded.
(Ex: Out of 135 Vendors 0 responded)

Unified Business

Ensure you are
on the “RFP - Services” Index page
when reviewing responses. Expand

the RFP you want to review by
Clicking the “Details” tab then the
“Responses” tab to see responses.

UNCLASSIFIED/Approved for Public Release
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For information about the RFP
Process, contact the

CHESS Customer Support

Team

at armychess@mail.mil
Or toll free at: (888) 232-4405

58
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